K? G- GPO/ 2515 /MWPP-47/ 2009 - 2011

©QEITN TILHTRTHT
' a@eaﬁ TSF

gar) — IV-A dorided, thdaed, id]'aa!‘F 0OF, 900F (mugea 2¢5, ¥w dxF NFR0) To. Naees

Dozheod sﬁﬁmdﬂ@a P Toxs gl Hulzeood

(wam’aasei
zosd; Homzer 17 ZoxN 2009, tonseds, BFeod: 198 Hpusr, 2009)

O dmrtds mRo®® (wsdbowidol) | WL, 20093 20096 BREE aaaradﬁe Inlaplel.afelat
TRRIDUT 2aR Bedewm, ORI, 2ebI0dmon mm 20093 BIOFLIE w&)i’bcﬁ)m h‘oai 9
aoam@h ﬁmm&a‘ Tz, aﬁécﬁ@ wﬁtsfqaseﬁocia Qﬁdfénﬂbﬁd

KARNATAKA ACT NO 9 OF 2009
(First Published in the Karnataka Gazetteé Extra-ordinary on the Nineteenth day of March, 2009)
/ y ) ‘ ‘ y
THE KARNATAKA STAMP (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2009
{Received the assent of the Governor on the sixteenth day of March, 2009)

An Act further to amend the Karnataka Stamp Act, 1957.

Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Stamp Act, 1957 (Karnataka Act 34 of
1957), for the purposes hereinafter appearing; :

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the suctleth year of Republic of India as
follows:-

1. Short title add Commencement.- (1) This Act may be called Karnataka Stamp
(Arnendment) Act, 2009.

(2) It shall come into force with effect from first day of Aﬁrﬂ 2009.

2. Amendment of section 45-A.- In the Kamataka Stamp Act, 1957 [Karnataka Act 34 of
1927) (hereinafter referred to a,s the prlncipal Act), in section 45-A, in sub-section (1),-

(@) for clause (h) and entries relating thereto, the following shall be substituted,
namely:-

'

“(h) a lease covered under item (iv) of Article 30:”



2
(b)

(eb)” shall be substituted.

In clause (i), for the words, brackets
(ea)”, the words, brackets and letters

L]

and letters _"under clause (eb) and clause
“under clause (e), clause (ea) and clause

3. Amendment of the Schedule.- In the schedule to the Principal Act,-

(1) In Article 5,-

(a) in clause (e), for sub-clause (if) and = entries relating thereto, the following

shall be substituted, namely:-

“(ill possession of the property is not delivered

0,25 rupee for every one hundred rupees
or part thereof on the market value equal
to the amount of consideration.”

(b) for clause (t).. and the entries relating ‘t-her_eto, the following shall be

substituted, namely:-

‘) (f relating to coristnlction or development or sale of
an irmmovable property, Including a multi-unit house
o1 building or unit of apartment or flat or portion of a’

reulti-storied building by a person having a stipulation.

thuat after construction or development, such property

shall be held jointly or severally by that person and the . the propetty, as the case may be, (which is
ouner or lessee, as'the case may be, of such property;  the subject matter of such transfer under
the agreement in accordance with the
. Provisions of section 28 of the Karnataka
. Stamp Act, 1957) or on the consideration
.- for such transfer whichever is higher:

or that it shall ‘
that a part of it shall be held Jjointly or

jointly or severally by them.

Explanation I:-
(1) the expression “lessee’. shall mean a
holder of a lease, for a period exeeeding

thirty years or more, or in perpetuity or .
any definite.

does not purport to be for
term.

(2) the expression "buildirig” shall mean a
one.

building having more than
apartment or flat or office
accommodation or portion of a multi:
storied building,

Ezplanation 11

and clause (h)
mortgage as the case may he, is executed between the
Same parties in pursuance of such agreement or its

records or memorandum, the stamp duty, if any,
already paid and recovered on

total duty leviable on the

conveyance or mortgage, as
the case may be

(_c] in sub clause (9, in column (3), for the words
hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

(2} for Article 11 and entries

namely:-

be sold jointly or severally by them or -
severally by .
thern and the remaining part- thereof shall be sold

the agreement or its
record or memorandum shall be adjusted towards the

one rupee for every one hundred rupees or

.part thereof on the.market value of the

property or the estimated cost of

- construction or proposed construction or

development or proposed development of

Provided that, if prof)'ei'_‘st_amp duty is paid’

‘under clause (e), (ea) and (eb) of Article 41

on a power of attorney executed between
the same parties in respect of the same

- property, then the stamp duty under this

_ - article shall be as per Article 5(1).”
For the purpose of clause(e), clause(f} - ) .

where subsequently conveyance or:

“fifty rupees” the words “two

relating thereto, the following shali be substituted,



-3

') Award.- that is to say, any decision in writing by .
an arbitrator or umpire, not being an award directing a
partition, on a reference made otherwise than by an
orcler of the Court in the course of a suit.

13) In Article 20,-

The same duty as a conveyance [under
Article 20(1)] on the amount or market
value of the property:(which is the subject
matter of award), whichever is higher.”

-

(@) in clause (1), in column (3), for the words “seven and a half percent” the
words “six percent” shall be substituted;

(b) in élause (é}. in column (2), after the words “securitization” the words
-and figures “under securitisation and reconstruction of ‘Financial Assets
and Enforcement of Security Interest Act, 2002” shall be inserted.

(4)  In Article 22,-

(@) in clause (a), in column (2), for the wdrds “four rupeés and ﬁfty pé.ise"
the words “five hundred rupees” shall be substituted:

(b) in clause (b), in column (3), for the words “fifty rupees” the words “five
hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

(5)

In Article 28, in the _“expianétion", after the words "Iméans"’ the words and

comma “father, mother,” shall be inserted.

(6) In Article 30, for clause (1) and

substituted, namely:-

“[1) Lease of imrhoveable_ property including an undggQ
leage or sub-lease and any agreement to let or sub-let
wnere by such lease, the rent is fixed, _or. fine or

premium or ‘money advanced or security deposit (as

the case may be) is paid or delivered,-

(il where the lease purports to be for a term not
exceeding five years. .

(i) where the lease purports to be for a term eﬁcceedlng
five years but not exceeding ten years. i

(ii) where the lease purports to be for a term

exceeding
ten years but not exceeding thirty years.

{iv) where the lease purports to be for a term exceeding
thirty years or in perpetuity or does not
be for any definite term

-under such lease.

purport to .

.'ehtﬁes relating thereto, the following shall be

one rupee for every one hundred rupees

-, or part thereof on the total amount of

average annual rent and fine or premium
or money advanced or security deposit, as
the case may be, payable or deliverable
under such lease.

two rupees for every one hundred rupees
or part thereof on the total amount of
average annual rent and fine or premium

- or money advanced or security deposit, as

the case may be, payable or deliverable

four rupees for every one hundred rupees
or part thereof on the total amount of
average annual rent and fine or premium
or money advanced or security deposit, as

the case may be, payable or deliverable
under such lease.

the same duty as a conveyance (Article 20 .
(1)], for the amount or value of such fine

“or premium or advance, as set forth in the

lease, in addition to duty which would












